TO: Board of Commissioners

FROM: Adam Lewandowski, Director of Athletic Programs & Facilities

Cody Nelson, Superintendent of Athletic Programs

THROUGH: Michael Benard, Executive Director

RE: YOUTH BASKETBALL UNIFORMS

DATE: July 16, 2025

STATEMENT OF THE ISSUE

The Wheaton Park District Youth Basketball Program has over 2,000 participants. All expenses are covered by registration fees in the 2025 athletic department budget.

Bid packets were sent to forty (41) companies and a bid notice was placed in the Daily Herald newspaper. Bids were officially opened on Tuesday, July 8, at 11A at the Wheaton Park District Park Services Center. Results for the nine qualified competing vendors are listed below. One bid submission was not accepted as the submission came in after the bid opening time.

I. Travel Basketball Uniforms

Vendor	Vipers 100 ea. Reversible Jersey	Vipers 100 ea. Reversible Short	Thunder 70 ea. Reversible Jersey	Thunder 70 ea. Reversible Short	Wheaton North (Boys) 70 ea. Reversible Jersey	Wheaton North (Boys) 70 ea. Reversible Short	Wheaton North (Girls) 30 ea. Reversible Jersey	Wheaton North (Girls) 30 ea. Reversible Short
Lansing Sport	Adult - \$34	Adult - \$34	Adult - \$34	Adult - \$34	Adult - \$34	Adult - \$34	Adult - \$34	Adult - \$34
Shop	Youth - \$34	Youth - \$34	Youth - \$34	Youth - \$34	Youth - \$34	Youth - \$34	Youth - \$34	Youth - \$34
Kirhofer's Sports	Adult - \$29.90	Adult - \$29.90	Adult - \$29.90	Adult - \$29.90	Adult - \$29.90	Adult - \$29.90	Adult - \$29.90	Adult - \$29.90
	Youth - \$29.90	Youth - \$29.90	Youth - \$29.90	Youth - \$29.90	Youth - \$29.90	Youth - \$29.90	Youth - \$29.90	Youth - \$29.90
The Perfect Swing	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$31
Sports	Youth - \$30	Youth - \$30	Youth - \$30	Youth - \$30	Youth - \$30	Youth - \$30	Youth - \$30	Youth - \$30
BSN Sports	Adult - \$52.50	Adult - \$52.50	Adult - \$52.50	Adult - \$52.50	Adult - \$52.50	Adult - \$52.50	Adult - \$52.50	Adult - \$52.50
	Youth - \$52.50	Youth - \$52.50	Youth - \$52.50	Youth - \$52.50	Youth - \$52.50	Youth - \$52.50	Youth - \$52.50	Youth - \$52.50
Riddell	Adult - \$35.50	Adult – \$44	Adult - \$35.50	Adult – \$44	Adult - \$35.50	Adult – \$44	Adult - \$35.50	Adult – \$44
	Youth - \$32.50	Youth - \$40	Youth - \$32.50	Youth - \$40	Youth - \$32.50	Youth - \$40	Youth - \$32.50	Youth - \$40
Kalci Soccer LLC	Adult - \$20	Adult - \$20	Adult - \$20	Adult - \$20	Adult - \$20	Adult - \$20	Adult - \$20	Adult - \$20
	Youth - \$20	Youth - \$20	Youth - \$20	Youth - \$20	Youth - \$20	Youth - \$20	Youth - \$20	Youth - \$20
Areli	Adult \$36.65	Adult \$36.65	Adult \$36.65	Adult \$36.65	Adult \$36.65	Adult \$36.65	Adult \$36.65	Adult \$36.65
	Youth - \$36.65	Youth - \$36.65	Youth - \$36.65	Youth - \$36.65	Youth - \$36.65	Youth - \$36.65	Youth - \$36.65	Youth - \$36.65
Santo Sports	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$31
	Youth - \$31	Youth - \$31	Youth - \$31	Youth - \$31	Youth - \$31	Youth - \$31	Youth - \$31	Youth - \$31
Undefeated	Adult - \$27	Adult - \$27	Adult - \$27	Adult - \$27	Adult - \$27	Adult - \$27	Adult - \$27	Adult - \$27
Sports Double Ply	Youth - \$25	Youth – \$27	Youth - \$25	Youth – \$27	Youth - \$25	Youth – \$27	Youth - \$25	Youth – \$27
Undefeated	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$39	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$39	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$39	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$39
Sports Single Ply	Youth - \$31	Youth - \$39	Youth - \$31	Youth - \$39	Youth - \$31	Youth - \$39	Youth - \$31	Youth - \$39



Vendor	Wheaton	Wheaton	Wheaton	Wheaton
	Warrenville	Warrenville	Warrenville	Warrenville
	South (Boys)	South (Boys)	South (Girls)	South (Girls)
	60 ea.	60 ea.	30 ea.	30 ea.
	Reversible	Reversible	Reversible	Reversible
	Jersey	Shorts	Jersey	Short
Lansing Sport	Adult - \$34	Adult - \$34	Adult - \$34	Adult - \$34
Shop	Youth - \$34	Youth - \$34	Youth - \$34	Youth - \$34
Kirhofer's Sports	Adult - \$29.90	Adult - \$29.90	Adult - \$29.90	Adult - \$29.90
	Youth - \$29.90	Youth - \$29.90	Youth - \$29.90	Youth - \$29.90
The Perfect	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$31
Swing Sports	Youth - \$30	Youth - \$30	Youth - \$30	Youth - \$30
BSN Sports	Adult – \$52.50	Adult – \$52.50	Adult – \$52.50	Adult – \$52.50
	Youth - \$52.50	Youth - \$52.50	Youth - \$52.50	Youth - \$52.50
Riddell	Adult - \$35.50	Adult – \$44	Adult - \$35.50	Adult – \$44
	Youth - \$32.50	Youth - \$40	Youth - \$32.50	Youth - \$40
Kalci Soccer LLC	Adult - \$20	Adult - \$20	Adult - \$20	Adult - \$20
	Youth - \$20	Youth - \$20	Youth - \$20	Youth - \$20
Areli	Adult \$36.65	Adult \$36.65	Adult \$36.65	Adult \$36.65
	Youth - \$36.65	Youth - \$36.65	Youth - \$36.65	Youth - \$36.65
Santo Sports	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$31
	Youth - \$31	Youth - \$31	Youth - \$31	Youth - \$31
Undefeated Sports Double Ply	Adult - \$27 Youth - \$25	Adult - \$27 Youth – \$27	Adult - \$27 Youth - \$25	Adult - \$27 Youth – \$27
Undefeated	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$39	Adult - \$31	Adult - \$39
Sports Single Ply	Youth - \$31	Youth - \$39	Youth - \$31	Youth - \$39

- Recommendations: Staff recommend awarding the below lowest qualified vendors in the respective bid specifications.
 - o Kalci Soccer LLC be awarded the Vipers reversible jersey.
 - o Kalci Soccer LLC be awarded the Vipers reversible shorts.
 - o Kalci Soccer LLC be awarded the Thunder reversible jersey.
 - o Kalci Soccer LLC be awarded the Thunder reversible shorts.
 - Kalci Soccer LLC be awarded the Wheaton North boys reversible jersey.
 - o Kalci Soccer LLC be awarded the Wheaton North boys reversible shorts.
 - o Kalci Soccer LLC be awarded the Wheaton North girls reversible jersey.
 - o Kalci Soccer LLC be awarded the Wheaton North girls reversible shorts.
 - Kalci Soccer LLC be awarded the Wheaton Warrenville South boys reversible jersey.
 - o Kalci Soccer LLC be awarded the Wheaton Warrenville South boys reversible shorts.
 - Kalci Soccer LLC be awarded the Wheaton Warrenville South girls reversible jersey.
 - Kalci Soccer LLC be awarded the Wheaton Warrenville South girls reversible shorts.

II. In-House Basketball Jersey

Vendor	1000 ea. Jersey 1 Adult	1000 ea. Jersey 1 Youth	1000 ea. Jersey 2 Adult	1000 ea. Jersey 2 Youth	
Lansing Sport Shop	\$13	\$13	\$13	\$13	
Kirhofer's Sports	\$11.25	\$11.25	\$11.25	\$11.25	
The Perfect Swing Sports	\$13	\$13	\$13	\$13	
BSN Sports	\$13.95	\$13.95	\$13.95	\$13.95	
Riddell	\$22.90	\$21.90	\$22.90	\$21.90	
Kalci Soccer LLC	\$10.50	\$10.50	\$10.50	\$10.50	
Areli	\$14.82	\$14.82	\$14.82	\$14.82	
Santo Sports	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Undefeated Sports	\$12.49	\$11.51	\$12.49	\$11.51	

- Recommendations: Staff recommend awarding the below lowest qualified vendors in the respective bid specifications.
 - Kalci Soccer LLC be awarded Jersey 1 adult.
 - Kalci Soccer LLC be awarded Jersey 1 youth.
 - Kalci Soccer LLC be awarded Jersey 2 adult.
 - Kalci Soccer LLC be awarded Jersey 2 youth.

Additional miscellaneous equipment will be purchased including ice packs, equipment bags, etc. Staff will purchase these supplies from the retailer providing the best price, and it is anticipated that they will be split between several companies.

REVENUE OR FUNDING IMPLICATIONS:

All expenses will be included in the Wheaton Park District athletic department budget and will be covered by registration fees. Quantities are approximate and may vary accordingly.

RECOMMENDATION:

Staff recommends that the Wheaton Park District Board of Commissioner's approve the 2025 Youth Basketball Uniforms bid results as presented.