TO: Board of Commissioners m

WHEATON PARK DISTRICT
FROM : Adam Lewandowski, Director of Athletic Programs & Facilities ) \
Cody Nelson, Superintendent of Athletic Programs g

Troy Clements, Athletic Manager %I

=

THROUGH: Michael Benard, Executive Director

RE: BASEBALL/SOFTBALL UNIFORMS AND ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT
DATE: December 17, 2025
SUMMARY:

The Wheaton Park District Youth Baseball and Softball Program has over 1,600 participants. All expenses are covered
by sponsorships, registration fees, and fundraising in the 2026 Athletic Department Baseball/Softball Budget.

Bid packets were sent to thirty-nine (39) companies and a bid notice was placed in the Daily Herald. Bids were
officially opened on Tuesday, November 12, 2025, at 10A at the Wheaton Park District Park Services Center. Results
for the seven qualified competing vendors are listed below. One bid submission was not accepted as the submission
came in after the bid opening time.

Bid Results:

I. BASEBALLS

Rawlings Rawlings Champro CBB-61 SAF-T-

Name RSGRLLB1 RSGRSLL1 SOFT Level 1 Baseball
60 doz. 30 doz. 10 doz.
Kirhofer’s Sports $60.00 $60.00 $23.00
Santo Sport Store $44.20 $44.20 §21.94
The Perfect Swing Sports $43.88 $43.88 $20.88
Undefeated Sports LLC No Bid No Bid $21.99
BSN Sports §55.27 §55.27 No Bid
Riddell $66.88*SUB $70.43*SUB $29.81
Pyramid School Products $48.95 $48.95 $24.99

e Recommendations: Staff recommend awarding the below lowest qualified vendors in the respective bid
specifications.
o The Perfect Swing Sports be awarded the Rawlings RSGRLLB1, Rawlings RSGRSLL1, and
Champro CBB-61 SAF-T-SOFT Level 1 Baseball.



SOFTBALLS

. Champro

Rawlings Rawlings csssgh:;:':;s T y

Name RSGC11BYLUC C12BYLUC AFE-T- CSB62 12" SAFE-T-

SOFT — Durahide Cover | SOFT — Durahide Cover
30 doz. 60 doz.
15 doz.

8 doz.
Kirhofer’s Sports $71.00 $71.00 $48.00 $48.00
Santo Sport Store $69.40 $69.40 $46.60 $46.60
The Perfect Swing Sports §70.98 §70.98 §45.78 $45.78
Undefeated Sports LLC No Bid No Bid $47.99 $47.99
BSN Sports $90.12 $90.12 No Bid No Bid
Riddell No Bid No Bid $79.89 §79.89
Pyramid School Products $79.95 §79.95 $55.50 $55.50

e Recommendations: Staff recommend awarding the below lowest qualified vendors in the respective bid
specifications.
o Santo Sport Store be awarded the Rawlings RSGC11BYLUC and Rawlings C12BYLUC Softball.
o The Perfect Swings Sports be awarded the Champro CSB63 11” SAFE-T-SOFT — Durahide
Cover and Champro CSB62 12” SAFE-T-SOFT — Durahide Cover Softball.

1I1. CAPS/VISORS
Replica Caps Replica Caps Cotton Twill Visors Cotton Twill Caps Cotton Twill Caps
Adult Youth PCTV-100Y GL271 GL271Y
Name MLE-350 MLB-350 With ETvlz:ll:?idered With Er'rl\vlz:ll:?idered With ETvl::;?idered
60 doz. 55 doz. 26 doz. 27 doz. 10 doz.
# # #
Kirhofer’s Sports $95.00 $95.00 $78.00 $78.00 $78.00
Santo Sport Store $90.48 $90.48 $88.20 $83.28 $83.28
The Perfect Swing Sports $87.98 $87.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Undefeated Sports LLC $96.00 $96.00 $80.00 $80.00 $80.00
BSN Sports No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Riddell No Bid No Bid $291.00*SUB $291.00*SUB $291.00*SUB
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

e Recommendations: Staff recommend awarding the below lowest qualified vendors in the respective bid

specifications.

o The Perfect Swing Sports be awarded the Replica Caps Adult MLB-350 and Replica Caps Youth

MLB-350.

o Kirhofer’s Sports be awarded the Cotton Twill Visors PCTV-100Y, Cotton Twill Caps GL271,
and Cotton Twill Caps GL271Y.




PANTS

Champro BPY | Champro BPA | Champro BP11 Champro BP11
Name Performance Performance Tournament Tournament
Pull-up Youth | Pull Up Adult Girl’s Women's
90 doz. 15 doz. 48 doz. 24 doz.
Kirhofer’s Sports $60.00 $72.00 $147.00 $171.00
Santo Sport Store $59.79 $69.74 $137.44 $162.30
The Perfect Swing Sports $58.68*SUB $69.18*SUB $145.98 $169.98
Undefeated Sports LLC $73.99 $73.99 $158.30 $183.40
BSN Sports No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Riddell $80.28 $117.76 $248.04 $255.50
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid $198.00 $198.00

e Recommendations: Staff recommend awarding the below lowest qualified vendors in the respective bid
specifications.

o Santo Sport Store be awarded the Champro BPY Performance Pull-up Youth, Champro BPA
Performance Pull Up Adult, Champro BP11 Tournament Girl’s, and Champro BP11
Tournament Women’s pant.

= The lower bids by The Perfect Swing Sports were substitutes and do not meet the quality
bid specifications.

V. SOCKS/BELTS

Champro AS2 Champro AS2 Champro AS2
Multi-Sport Multi-Sport Multi-Sport Chamgro AOGO
Name . Adult Brute

Sock Small Sock Medium Sock Large 32 doz
48 doz. 27 doz. 20 doz. )
Kirhofer’s Sports $27.00 $27.00 $27.00 $39.00
Santo Sport Store $24.60 $24.60 $24.60 $37.14
The Perfect Swing Sports $24.28 $24.28 $24.28 $36.58
Undefeated Sports LLC $25.50 $25.50 $25.50 $39.50
BSN Sports No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Riddell $38.16 $38.16 $38.16 $52.68
Pyramid School Products $28.20 $28.20 $28.20 $42.00

e Recommendations: Staff recommend awarding the below lowest qualified vendors in the respective bid
specifications.
o The Perfect Swing Sports be awarded the Champro Multi-Sport AS2 Small Sock, Champro
Multi-Sport AS2 Medium Sock, Champro Multi-Sport AS2 Large Sock, and Champro A060
Adult Brute belt.



VI UNIFORMS

791 Youth 1518 Youth 1517 Cutter 1522 Ladies
791 Youth Nextgen | CutterJersey | Jersey W/ 1523 Girls Cutter | 0 "
Nextgen Wicking Tee W/ Team Team Name, Jersey W/ Team Y
. W/ Team
Name Wicking Tee W/ Team Name, Sleeve Logo, Name, Sleeve Name. Sleeve
1 Logo Name, Sleeve Logo, Number Logo, Number Logo I'\lumber
650 ea. Sleeve Logo Number 200 ea. 175 ea. gz;o ca
350 ea. 230 ea. )

. $18.00 $18.00 $18.00 $18.00
Kirhofar's Sports >4.00 56.00 $15.00*SUB | $15.00*SUB $15.00*SUB $15.00*SUB
Santo Sport Store $5.73 $7.23 $12.89 $13.14 $12.89 $13.14

The Perfect Swing Sports $5.88 $7.38 $12.78 $12.78 $12.78 $12.78
Undefeated Sports LLC $5.80 $7.40 $12.90 $13.20 $12.90 $13.20
BSN Sports No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Riddell $16.25 $16.25 $22.01 $27.20 $21.99 $22.94

Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

e Recommendations: Staff recommend awarding the below lowest qualified vendors in the respective bid
specifications.

o Kirhofer’s Sports be awarded the 791 Youth Nextgen Wicking Tee 1 Logo and 791 Youth Nextgen
Wicking Tee W/ Team Name, Sleeve Logo uniform.

o The Perfect Swing Sports be awarded the 1518 Youth Cutter Jersey W/ Team Name, Sleeve Logo,
Number; 1517 Cutter Jersey W/ Team Name, Sleeve Logo, Number; 1523 Girls Cutter Jersey W/
Team Name, Sleeve Logo, Number; and 1522 Ladies Cutter Jersey W/ Team Name, Sleeve Logo,
Number uniform.

VII. BATS
24” (-12) (2 25” (-12) (2 26” (-12) (2 25” (-10) (2 26” (-10) (2 27” (-10) (2
Name 1/4” Barrel) 1/4” Barrel) 1/4” Barrel) 1/4” Barrel) 1/4” Barrel) 1/4” Barrel)
2 ea. 2 ea. 2 ea. 2 ea. 8 ea. 2 ea.
Kirhofer’s Sports $25.00 $25.00 $25.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00
Santo Sport Store $24.40 $24.40 $24.40 No Bid $40.40 $40.40
The Perfect Swing Sports $24.88 $24.88 $24.88 $39.88 $39.88 $39.88
Undefeated Sports LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BSN Sports No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Riddell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pyramid School Products $29.00 $29.00 $29.00 No Bid $43.50 $43.50

e Recommendations: Staff recommend awarding the below lowest qualified vendors in the respective bid
specifications.
o Santo Sport Store be awarded the 24” (-12) (2 1/4” barrel), 25” (-12) (2 1/4” barrel), and 26” (-12)
(2 1/4” barrel) bat.
o The Perfect Swing Sports be awarded the 25” (-10) (2 1/4” barrel), 26” (-10) (2 1/4" barrel), and
27” (-10) (2 1/4" barrel) bat.



VIII. BATS (Continued)
28" (-10) (2 29” (-10) (2 28" (-10) (2 29” (-10) (2 30” (-10) (2 | 29" (-8) (25/8"
Name 1/4” Barrel) 1/4” Barrel) 5/8” Barrel) 5/8” Barrel) 5/8” Barrel) Barrel)
2ea. 2 ea. 3ea. 2ea. Sea. 2 ea.

Kirhofer’s Sports $40.00 $40.00 $48.00 $48.00 $48.00 $78.00
Santo Sport Store $40.40 $40.40 $48.38 $48.38 $48.38 No Bid
The Perfect Swing Sports $39.88 $39.88 $47.98 $47.98 $47.98 No Bid
Undefeated Sports LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BSN Sports No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Riddell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pyramid School Products $43.50 $43.50 $52.95 $52.95 $52.95 $228.00

e Recommendations: Staff recommend awarding the below lowest qualified vendors in the respective bid

specifications.

o The Perfect Swing Sports be awarded the 28” (-10) (2 1/4" barrel), 29” (-10) (2 1/4" barrel), 28”
(-10) (2 5/8” barrel), 29” (-10) (2 5/8” barrel), and 30” (-10) (2 5/8” barrel) bat.
o Kirhofer’s Sports be awarded the 29” (-8) (2 5/8” barrel) bat.

BATS (Continued)
30” (-8) (25/8” | 31" (-8) (25/8” | 30" (-5) (25/8” | 31" (-5) (25/8" | 32" (-5) (25/8"
Name Barrel) Barrel) Barrel) USABat | Barrel) USABat | Barrel) USABat
2 ea. 2 ea. 2 ea. 2 ea. 2 ea.
Kirhofer’s Sports $78.00 $78.00 $240.00 $240.00 $240.00
Santo Sport Store $81.33 $81.33 $134.84 $134.84 $134.84
The Perfect Swing Sports $79.98 $79.98 $138.58 $138.58 $138.58
Undefeated Sports LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BSN Sports No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Riddell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pyramid School Products $228.00 $228.00 $144.95 $144.95 $144.95

e Recommendations: Staff recommend awarding the below lowest qualified vendors in the respective bid

specifications.

o Kirhofer’s Sports be awarded the 30” (-8) (2 5/8” barrel) and 31” (-8) (2 5/8” barrel) bat.
o Santo Sport Store be awarded the 30” (-5) (2 5/8” barrel) USABat, 31” (-5) (2 5/8” barrel)
USABat, and 32” (-5) (2 5/8” barrel) USABat bat.




X. BATS (Continued)

Name SB 25” (-10) | SB26”(-10) | SB27”(-10) | SB28” (-10) | SB29” (-10) | SB 30" (-10) | SB 31" (-10)
4 ea. 3 ea. 2 ea. 3 ea. 7 ea. 9 ea. 2 ea.
Kirhofer’s Sports $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $42.00 $42.00 $42.00 $42.00
Santo Sport Store $27.90 $27.90 $27.90 $27.90 $27.90 $27.90 $42.35
The Perfect Swing $27.98 $27.98 $27.98 $27.98 $27.98 $27.98 $43.88
Sports
U"defeﬁec" Sports No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BSN Sports No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Riddell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pyramid School $30.95 $30.95 $30.95 $30.95 $30.95 $30.95 $46.00
Products

e Recommendations: Staff recommend awarding the below lowest qualified vendors in the respective bid
specifications.
o Santo Sport Store be awarded the SB 25” (-10), SB 26” (-10), SB 27” (-10), SB 28” (-10), SB 29”
(-10), and SB 30” (-10) bat.
o Kirhofer’s Sports be awarded the SB 31” (-10) bat.

XI. BATS (Continued)
SB 30” (-10) SB 31” (-10) SB 32" (-10)
Name 2025 Demarini CF Bat 2025 Demarini CF Bat 2025 Demarini CF Bat
WBD2550 WBD2550 WBD2550
4 ea. 4 ea. 4 ea.
Kirhofer’s Sports $290.00 $290.00 $290.00
Santo Sport Store $298.74 $298.74 $298.74
The Perfect Swing Sports $304.98 $304.98 $304.98
Undefeated Sports LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid
BSN Sports No Bid No Bid No Bid
Riddell No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pyramid School Products $329.00 $329.00 $329.00

e Recommendations: Staff recommend awarding the below lowest qualified vendors in the respective bid

specifications.

o Kirhofer’s Sports be awarded the SB 30” (-10) 2025 Demarini CF Bat WBD2550, SB 31” (-10)
2025 Demarini CF Bat WBD2550, and SB 32” (-10) 2025 Demarini CF Bat WBD2550 bat.




XII. HELMETS
Champro Champro ::::JP:;(
HXU HX Champro HXU Champro HXU HXFPU HX .
. . ) Rookie
Rookie HX Rookie HX Rookie Rookie .
. . . Fastpitch
Batting Batting Helmet | Batting Helmet Fastpitch .
Name . ) . Batting
Helmet Med Junior - Lg Senior - Batting Helmet Lg
Small T-Ball Black Black Helmet Med .
- Black 6 Junior - Black Seiior =
e 3 ea. Black
12 ea. 6 ea.
3 ea.
Kirhofer’s Sports $14.25 $14.50 $16.00 §23.00 $23.00
Santo Sport Store $13.93 $14.48 §15.28 §22.72 §22.72
The Perfect Swing Sports $13.98 $14.78 $15.38 $21.98 $21.98
Undefeated Sports LLC $14.99 $15.49 $16.09 $20.70 $20.70
BSN Sports No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Riddell $20.98 §21.76 §22.52 $36.87 $36.87
Pyramid School Products $18.59 $18.59 §19.59 $26.99 $26.99

e Recommendations: Staff recommend awarding the below lowest qualified vendors in the respective bid

specifications.

o Santo Sport Store be awarded the Champro HXU HX Rookie Batting Helmet Small T-Ball —
Black, Champro HXU HX Rookie Batting Helmet Med Junior — Black, and Champro HXU HX
Rookie Batting Helmet Large Senior — Black helmet.

o Undefeated Sports be awarded the Champro HXFPU HX Rookie Fastpitch Batting Helmet Med

Junior — Black and Champro HXFPU HX Rookie Fastpitch Batting Helmet Large Senior -Black
helmet.

XIII. MISCELLANEOUS
Champro B047 o n07 Champro B0O50 Champro B081 | Champro CMO3 Champro E50
Movable ampro Hanvy Duty Brute 2 Batting | Sentry Fielder’s Jumbo All-
Name Pitcher Rubber Scorebook Rubber Batting Tee Facemask Black Purpose Bag on
70 ea. Tee Wheels Black
10 ea. 8 ea. 20 ea.
10 ea. 8 ea.
Kirhofer’s Sports $14.00 $3.75 $13.00 $43.00 $18.00 $66.00
Santo Sport Store $13.79 $3.54 $13.49 $42.72 $17.70 $65.47
The Perfect Swing Sports $12.98 $3.38 $11.98 $41.98 $17.08 $64.98
Undefeated Sports LLC $12.20 $3.43 $13.09 $42.99 $18.99 $67.79
BSN Sports $20.62*SUB $4.92*SUB $22.04*sUB No Bid No Bid $108.58*SUB
Riddell $17.91 $6.84 $16.18 $57.66 No Bid $87.89
Pyramid School Products $15.99 $3.90 $22.99 $50.99 $20.50 $76.95

e Recommendations: Staff recommend awarding the below lowest qualified vendors in the respective bid

specifications.

o Undefeated Sports LLC be awarded the Champro B047 Movable pitcher rubber.
o The Perfect Swing Sports be awarded the Champro A07 Scorebook, Champro B050 Heavy Duty
Rubber Batting Tee, Champro B081 Brute 2 Batting Tee, Champro CM03 Sentry Fielder’s

7




Facemask Black, and Champro E50 Jumbo All-Purpose Bag on Wheels Black.

XIV. CATCHER’S GEAR

CMHXU
CMHXU Cannon Cannon . CP103 Optimus MVP CP102 Optimus
Catcher’s Helmet Catcher’s CP104 Optimus MV:‘ Chest Chest Protector — MVP Chest
Name - Youth Helmet — Protec;or -12 13.5” Protector — 15”
12 ea. Adult ea- 3ea. 3 ea.
12 ea.

Kirhofer’s Sports $60.00 $60.00 $20.00 $27.00 $30.00
Santo Sport Store $59.19 $59.19 $19.47 $25.88 $30.30
The Perfect Swing Sports §59.78 $59.78 $19.28 $25.48 §29.28
Undefeated Sports LLC $58.98 $58.98 $19.39 §25.49 $29.98
BSN Sports No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Riddell $81.55 $81.55 $26.65 $34.46 $39.17
Pyramid School Products $69.50 $69.50 $22.50 $29.50 $33.95

e Recommendations: Staff recommend awarding the below lowest qualified vendors in the respective bid
specifications.
o Undefeated Sports LLC be awarded the CMHXU Cannon Catcher’s Helmet — Youth and
CMHXU Cannon Catcher’s Helmet — Adult.
o The Perfect Swing Sports be awarded the CP104 Optimus MVP Chest Protector — 12, CP103
Optimus MVP Chest Protector — 13.5”, and CP102 Optimus MVP Chest Protector — 15”.

XV. CATCHER’S GEAR (Continued)

CG106
CG111 Optimus Optimus .
MVP Double MVP Double CG104 Optimus MVP
. . Double Knee Shin Guard
Name Knee Shin Guard Knee Shin "ol s
12“ Shin Length Guard 13.5" 145 Sl';ln Length
3 ea. Shin Length e
3 ea.
Kirhofer’s Sports $30.00 $33.00 $39.00
Santo Sport Store $29.30 $32.74 $37.84
The Perfect Swing Sports $29.38 $32.98 $37.88
Undefeated Sports LLC $29.99 $32.98 $39.98
BSN Sports No Bid No Bid No Bid
Riddell $39.95 S44.65 §57.26
Pyramid School Products $33.95 $37.95 $43.59

e Recommendations: Staff recommend awarding the below lowest qualified vendors in the respective bid
specifications.
o Santo Sport Store be awarded the CG111 Optimus MVP Double Knee Shin Guard 12” Shin
Length, CG106 Optimus MVP Double Knee Shin Guard 13.5” Shin Length, and CG104 Optimus
MVP Double Knee Shin Guard 14.5” Shin Length.



XVI. CATCHER’S GEAR (Continued)

Rawlings Renegade Rawlings Renegade Rawlings Shut Out 31” | Rawlings Shut Out 33"
N 31.5in P-RCM3158B 32.5 in P-RCM325B R00713825 Softball R00704422 Softball

ame Glove Glove Glove Glove

6 ea. 6 ea. 6 ea. 6 ea.
Kirhofer’s Sports $37.00 $37.00 $50.00 $82.00
Santo Sport Store $35.93 $37.89 $49.14 $83.44
The Perfect Swing Sports $35.88 $37.88 $48.98 $80.98
Undefeated Sports LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BSN Sports No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Riddell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pyramid School Products $41.95 $43.95 $56.95 $93.95

e Recommendations: Staff recommend awarding the below lowest qualified vendors in the respective bid
specifications.
o The Perfect Swing Sports be awarded the Rawlings Renegade 31.5 P-RCM315B Glove, Rawlings
Shut Out 31” R00713825 Softball Glove, and Rawlings Shut Out 33” R00704422 Softball Glove.
o Kirhofer’s Sports be awarded the Rawlings Renegade 32.5 in P-RCM325B Glove.

Additional miscellaneous equipment will be purchased including ice packs, bat bags, etc. Staff will purchase these
supplies from the retailer providing the best price, and it is anticipated that they will be split between several
companies.

PREVIOUS COMMITTEE/BOARD ACTION:
On December 18, 2024 the Wheaton Park District Board of Commissioner’s approved the 2025 Baseball/Softball
uniforms and athletic equipment bid results presented by staff.

REVENUE OR FUNDING IMPLICATIONS:
All expenses will be included in the Wheaton Park District Baseball/Softball fund and will be covered by registration
fees, fundraising, and sponsorships. Quantities are approximate and may vary accordingly.

ATTACHMENTS:
Summary of the Awarded Vendors per Baseball/Softball Equipment Bid Category

RECOMMENDATION:
Staff recommends that the Wheaton Park District Board of Commissioner’s approve the 2026 Baseball/Softball
uniforms and athletic equipment bid results as presented.




