



TO: Board of Commissioners

FROM : Mary Beth Cleary, Director of Recreation
Brad Keene, Athletic Director
Ron Elenbaas, Equipment Manager

THROUGH: Michael Benard, Executive Director

RE: BASEBALL/SOFTBALL UNIFORMS AND ATHLETIC EQUIPMENT

DATE: October 30, 2015

SUMMARY:

The Wheaton Park District Youth Baseball and Girls' Softball Program has over 1,500 participants. Official bids were mailed or sent electronically for uniforms, and equipment. All expenses are covered by sponsorships, registration fees, and fundraisers, in the 2016 Recreation Department Baseball/Softball Budget.

Bid packets were sent to fourteen companies and a bid notice was placed in the Daily Herald newspaper. On Tuesday, October 20, 2015 at 10 am at the DuPage Historical Museum Office, bids were officially opened.

Bid Results:

I. BASEBALLS

	Rawlings RLLB - 60 doz.	Rawlings RLLB1 - 50 doz.	Rawlings RPLB - 70 doz.	Rawlings R100 HS - 20 doz.
Santo Sports	\$45.64	\$33.84	<i>\$45.64</i>	<i>\$59.84</i>
Kirhofer's	<i>\$45.64</i>	<i>\$33.38</i>	\$45.64	\$59.90
School Specialty, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
BSN Sports	\$56.79	\$41.26	\$41.36*	\$87.66
Pyramid School Products	\$48.79	\$35.49	\$48.79	\$63.00
Riddell	\$23.00*	23.00*	\$30.15*	\$28.00*
American Soccer, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Cannon Sports, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

*= Alternate bid

Note: The characteristics which we are concerned with when buying balls include; stitching, cover, and staying round for an extended time. The balls are used for games and as practice balls after initial use.

Recommendations:

- **We recommend Kirhofer's be awarded the Rawlings RLLB & RLLB1 baseball bids. We recommend Santo Sports be awarded the Rawlings RPLB & R100HS baseball bid.** They are the lowest qualified bidder in the respective bid specifications. Riddell submitted alternate bids which staff does not accept.

II. SOFTBALLS

	Worth (NSA) C11NYL 24 doz.	Worth (NSA) C12NYL 66 doz.	Easton Incrediball 11" A122608 Soft-Stitch 12 doz.	Easton Incrediball 11" A122604 Soft-Touch 12 doz.	Easton Indrediball 9" A122101 Soft Touch Baseballs 20 doz.
Santo Sports	\$53.20	\$53.20	\$44.80	\$44.80	\$34.80
Kirhofer's	\$56.90	\$56.90	\$57.50	\$57.50	\$41.70
School Specialty, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
BSN Sports	\$69.82	\$69.82	\$46.32	\$46.32	\$35.04
Pyramid School Products	\$59.80	\$59.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Riddell	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
American Soccer, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Cannon Sports, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Note: The characteristics which we are concerned with when buying balls include; stitching, cover, and staying round for an extended time. The balls are used for games and as practice balls after initial use.

Recommendations:

- **We recommend Santo Sports be awarded the Worth Softball bids and Easton Incrediball bids.** They are the lowest qualified bidder in the respective bid specifications.

III. OUTDOOR CAPS

	Replica Caps MLB-300 Adult 30 doz.	Replica Caps MLB-300 Youth 25 doz.	Replica Visor MLB-175 Adult 10 doz.	Cotton Twill Visor PCTV-100 with embroidered brush script W Adult 20 doz.	Cotton Twill Visor PCTV-100Y with embroidered brush script W Youth 13 doz.	Cotton Twill Caps GL271 with embroidered brush script W Adult 13 doz.	Cotton Twill Caps GL271Y with embroidered brush script W Youth 8 doz.
Santo Sports	\$59.14	\$59.14	\$56.62	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Kirhofer's	\$64.90	\$64.90	\$61.90	\$51.90	\$51.90	\$49.90	\$49.90
School Specialty, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
BSN Sports	\$69.00	\$69.00	No Bid	\$63.00	\$63.00	\$59.40	\$59.40
Pyramid School Products	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Riddell	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$126.00*	\$126.00*
American Soccer, Inc.	\$86.28	\$86.28	\$86.28	\$92.28	\$92.28	\$92.28	\$92.28
Cannon Sports, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

*= Alternate bid

Recommendation:

- **We recommend that the replica caps & visors bids be awarded to Santo Sports for the Adult MLB-300, Youth MLB-300, and visor adult MLB-175. We recommend that the cotton twill visors bids PCTV-100, PCTB 100Y and the cotton twill caps bids GL271, GL271Y with embroidered brush script W bid be awarded to Kirhofer's.** They are the lowest qualified bidders in the respective bid specifications.

IV. PANTS

	Wilson WTA 4374 Adult 5 doz.	Wilson WTA 4204 Youth 25 doz.	Rawlings BEP31 8 doz.	Rawlings YBEP31 2 doz.	High Five 14 oz. belt loop pro Style low rise style 15052 pants 6 doz.	High Five 14 oz. belt loop pro Style low rise style 15053 pants 6 doz.	Alleson Athletic PWRPBP Baseball Pants 6 doz.
Santo Sports	\$105.00	\$67.08	\$108.72	\$77.52	No Bid	No Bid	\$257.40
Kirhofer's	\$116.00	\$74.00	\$113.00	\$80.00	\$189.00	\$179.00	\$279.00
School Specialty, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
BSN Sports	\$122.40	\$77.88	\$126.00	\$89.40	\$166.20	\$153.00	\$268.20
Pyramid School Products	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Riddell	\$84.00*	\$60.00*	\$217.20*	\$202.80*	\$203.40	\$185.52	No Bid
American Soccer, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Cannon Sports, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

*= Alternate bid

Recommendation:

- **We recommend that Santo Sports be awarded the Wilson WTA 4374 Adult, WTA 4204 Youth, Rawlings BEP31 & YBEP31 baseball pants bid. We recommend BSN Sports be awarded the High Five 15052 & 15053 pants. We recommend that Santo Sports be awarded the Alleson Athletic PWRPBP baseball pants. . They are the lowest qualified bidders in the respective bid specifications. Riddell submitted an alternate bid which staff does not accept.**

V. JERSEYS/BELTS

	Majestic Jerseys 6840-M6A (Adult) Jerseys 13 doz.	Majestic Jerseys 1922-M2R (Adult) Jersey Tee 5 doz.	Majestic Jerseys 1928- M2R Youth Jersey Tee 10 doz.	Teamwork Archer Jerseys Y1264 2 doz.	Teamwork Archer Jerseys W1244 2 doz.	Adams Bolco Style #26 1 ^{1/2} inch belts 8 doz.
Santo Sports	\$393.36	\$116.28	\$105.24	No Bid	No Bid	\$26.28
Kirhofer's	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$295.00	\$309.00	\$27.00
School Specialty, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
BSN Sports	No Bid	\$147.00	\$135.00	\$258.00	\$270.00	\$18.60*
Pyramid School Products	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Riddell	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$53.28*
American Soccer, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$50.18
Cannon Sports, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

*= Alternate bid

Recommendation:

- **We recommend the Majestic Jerseys 6840-M6A (Adult), 1922-M2R (Adult) and 1928-M2R Youth bids be awarded to Santos Sports. We recommend Teamwork Archer Jerseys Y1264 & W1244 bids be awarded to BSN Sports. We recommend Adams Bolco Style #26 1½ inch belts be awarded to Santo Sports. They are the lowest qualified bidders in the respective bid specifications. BSN Sports and Riddle submitted an alternate bid on Adams Bolco Style #26 1½ inch belts which staff does not accept.**

VI. SOCKS

	Twin City Socks 33 Doz. OBR	Twin City Socks 12 Doz. OBK
Santo Sports	<i>\$34.19</i>	<i>\$34.19</i>
Kirhofer's	\$34.95	\$34.95
School Specialty, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid
BSN Sports	\$38.50	\$38.50
Pyramid School Products	No Bid	No Bid
Riddell	\$49.32	\$49.32
American Soccer, Inc.	\$38.16	\$38.16
Cannon Sports, Inc.	No Bid	No Bid

Recommendation:

- **We recommend the sock bid be awarded to Santo Sports.** They are the lowest qualified bidders in the respective bid specifications.

VII. MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS

Additional miscellaneous supplies will be purchased including helmets, baseball bats, chest protectors, leg guards, batting T's, bases, scorebooks, bat bags, equipment bags, rulebooks, etc. Staff will purchase these supplies from the retailer providing the best price, and will be split between several companies.

PREVIOUS COMMITTEE/BOARD ACTION:

N/A

REVENUE OR FUNDING IMPLICATIONS:

All expenses will be included in the Wheaton Park District Baseball/Softball fund and will be covered by registration fees, fundraisers and sponsorships.

STAKEHOLDER PROCESS:

N/A

LEGAL REVIEW:

N/A

ATTACHMENTS:

N/A

ALTERNATIVES:

N/A

RECOMMENDATION:

It is recommended that the Wheaton Park District Board of Commissioner's approve the 2016 Baseball/Softball uniforms and athletic equipment bid results as recommended by staff.