
                               

                                     
TO:  Board of Commissioners 
 
FROM:  Justin Kirtland, Golf Course Superintendent 
  Daniel Novak, Director of Arrowhead Operations  
 
THROUGH: Michael Benard, Executive Director 
 
RE: Golf Course Chemicals 
 
DATE:  October 15, 2025 
 
SUMMARY:  
A variety of different chemicals are used in the maintenance of the golf course.  To maximize resources, we opened the process to bidders for the chemicals that 
we use or may use on a regular basis.  
 
There are a variety of specialty chemicals and fertilizers that are used in the maintenance of a golf course.  Many of the products used change from year to year 
based on growing conditions (precipitation and temperature) and threats from pests and disease and may need to be purchased at a moment’s notice to react to a 
particular condition.  Not all items will be purchased during the season, but staff prefers to bid for any product that could potentially go over the $10,000 quote 
threshold in case immediate action is necessary.  
 
Staff started the selective use of off-brand and generic chemicals over ten years ago and would like to use them whenever practical to better manage our resources 
without compromising turf health or course conditions.  However, just because a chemical has the same active ingredient as a name brand does not mean it uses the 
same technology.  Because of this we would prefer to use name brands until we are able to test the off brands or generics ourselves or can get reliable information 
from others in the industry about the effectiveness of each.  We have worked diligently to gather information on these products.  Some have not worked well but 
others have proven to be effective and are now part of our regular program.  We will continue to explore generic and off-brand options next year and in the future. 
 
You will notice in the bid results that we have not always chosen the least expensive chemical when an alternative was offered.  This is because not all alternates 
are comparable to the item bid.  Many of these chemicals have different formulations or release rates that make them difficult to control and, in many cases, 
increase the number of applications required.  In other cases, the active ingredients are different, and the products are not the same.  We may have chosen to accept 
bids for alternatives as well as the original product in some cases to allow for the testing of products and to use them if they prove effective.     
 
 
 
 



PREVIOUS COMMITTEE/BOARD ACTION:                           
The Board of Commissioners approved a similar list of chemicals and fertilizers after going to bid in September of 2024 at the regular October Meeting.   
 
REVENUE OR FUNDING IMPLICATIONS: 
$225,000 has been requested in the 2026 golf course operating budget in account 60-601-000-53-5335-0000 (Chemicals and Fertilizer).  The total spent on all 
items will fit within this budgeted amount. 
   
ALTERNATIVES: 
Chemicals and fertilizers are an integral part of the maintenance of the golf course.  Using the most appropriate products allows us to maximize effectiveness while 
minimizing cost, staff time and application rates.  Significantly decreasing or eliminating the use of these products would have an almost immediate negative 
impact on playing conditions and could result in serious loss of turf.   
 
RECOMMENDATION: 
It is recommended that the Wheaton Park District Board of Commissioners approve bids highlighted in yellow on the Attached Chart.  The breakdown is as 
follows: 
 
Advanced Turf Solutions of Geneva, IL for: Isoxaben in the amount of $194.25, Prohexadione in the amount of $1,520.50.00 for per/case, Defendor in the amount 
of $852.52 per/case, Mesotrione 21-22-4 in the amount of $56.41 per bag, Gold Standard 45 in the amount of $207.27 for 2.5 gallons, 22-0-4 w/ZnB 50% XCU in 
the amount of $979.90 per ton, Advanced HGT 80/20 seed for 297.50 per/bag, Aloft in the amount of $675.30 for 64oz,  Command in the amount of $144.93 for 
2.5 gallons 
 
Clesen’s of Linconshire, IL for: Chlorantraniliprole in the amount of $1,100.00  per case, Game On in the amount of $171.85 for 2.5 gallons, Fluazinam in the 
amount of $457.10 per case,  Propamocarb in the amount of $97.55 for 1 gallon, Chlorothalonil in the amount of $118.50 per case, Cutless MEC in the amount of 
$1,317.50 for 2.5 gallons, and Iprodione in the amount of $159.55 for 2.5 gallons.  
 
Pendleton Turf Supply of Waterford, WI for: Tebuconazole in the amount of $39.40 per gallon, Trinexapac-ethyl in the amount of $220.00 for 2.5 gallons, 
Propiconazole in the amount of $110 for 2.5 gallons, Paclobutrazol in the amount of $100.00 per gallon, and Thiophanate-methyl in the amount of $101.55 for 2.5 
gallons. 
 
 Conserve FS of Tinley Park, IL for Carbaryl in the amount of $175.00 for 2.5 gallons. 
 
Simplot AB Retail of Downers Grove, IL for: Syngenta Winter Solution in the amount of $6,572.00 per unit, Syngenta A2Z Solution in the amount of $8181.00 
per unit, Daconil Action in the amount of $265.00 for 2.5 gallons, Daconil Weatherstick in the amount of $210.00 for 2.5 gallons, Syngenta Forte Solution in the 
amount of $19,178.00 per unit, Syngenta Fairy Ring Solution in the amount of $9008.00 per unit, Signature Extra in the amount of $184.88 per 5.5 lbs, Serata in 
the amount of $459.81 for 35oz, Tartan in the amount of $981.35 for 2.5 gallons, Andersons 9-12-6 HCU in the amount of 41.40 per bag, Rely in the amount of 
$200 for 2.5 gallons, Forte in the amount of $1200.00 for 2.5 gallons, Reslia in the amount of $881.56 per case, Tetrino in the amount of $1952.00 per case 
 
Bid Results  
Notice for potential bidders was published on September 10, 2025, and bids were received until 10:00 AM on September 22nd.  Bids were received from five 
vendors.  These were: Advanced Turf Solutions of Geneva, IL; Clesens of Lincolnshire, IL; Pendelton Turf Supply, Inc of Waterford, WI; Conserve FS of Tinley 
Park, IL; Simplot AB Retail of Downers Grove, IL. Bid results are as follows: 
 



 

Chemical+A1:G40 Bid Opening 9/22/2025 at 10:00am
Wheaton Park District 1000 Manchester, Wheaton IL 

Product Package Advanced Turf Pendelton Clesens Conserve FS Simplot
!"#AB#CDEFG#CBHE!I-.CGI# /E.#GC no bid no bid 6,708.00$                 no bid 6,572.00$            
MBN.OI#DPI-BE /EAD- 54.64$                 39.40$             43.15$                       48.00$                41.72$                  
MHG#B4DRDOSBCT"- U9WEAD- 249.41$               220.00$           282.78$                     300.00$              245.72$               
!"#AB#CDEXU< /E.#GC no bid no bid 8,318.00$                 no bid 8,181.00$            
ZDOI#G-EXOCGI# U9WEAD- no bid no bid 265.00$                     no bid 265.00$               
ZDOI#G-EFBDCTBH>CGO? U9WEAD- no bid no bid 210.00$                     no bid 210.00$               
@>I4DNB# /EAD- 194.25$               no bid no bid no bid 194.25$               
!"#AB#CDEAIHCBE!I-.CGI# /E.#GC no bid no bid 19,178.00$               no bid 19,178.00$         
!"#AB#CDEADGH"EBG#AE!I-.CGI# /E.#GC no bid no bid 9,257.00$                 no bid 9,008.00$            
CHITB4DaGI#B RBHbOD>B 1,520.50$           1,584.00$       no bid no bid 1,584.00$            
cT-IHD#CHD#G-GRHI-B RBHbOD>B 2,700.00$           2,800.00$       1,100.00$                 2,700.00$          3,400.00$            
dDeBEf# U9WEAD- 171.88$               no bid 171.85$                     no bid 171.87$               
ZBgB#aIH RBHbOD>B 852.52$               no bid 852.50$                     no bid 852.50$               
A-.DPG#De RBHbOD>B 1,340.00$           840.00$           457.10$                     1,009.00$          1,063.59$            
CHIRGOI#DPI-B U9WEAD- 159.18$               110.00$           131.55$                     150.00$              132.62$               
!GA#DC.HBEh4CHD W9WE-N 199.88$               no bid 199.88$                     no bid 184.88$               
CHIRDeIODHN /EAD- 299.00$               no bid 97.55$                       245.00$              217.88$               
iB>ICHGI#BEU/SUUSM RBHbNDA 56.41$                 no bid 75.07$                       59.60$                61.97$                  
!BHDCD kWIP 474.81$               no bid 474.81$                     no bid 459.81$               
cDHNDH"- U9WEAD- 210.00$               no bid no bid 175.00$              no bid
dI-aE!CD#aDHaEMW U9WEAD- 207.27$               120.00$           no bid no bid no bid
CDO-IN.CHDPI- /EAD- 187.00$               100.00$           145.10$                     155.00$              106.67$               
MDHCD# U9WEAD- 1,033.00$           no bid 1,073.00$                 no bid 981.35$               
UUSlSMEmb<#nEWloEpcT RBHbCI# 979.90$               no bid no bid no bid no bid
cT-IHICTD-I#G- RBHbOD>B 211.40$               147.56$           118.50$                     135.00$              168.24$               
X#aBH>I#>ErS/USsEtcT RBHbNDA 44.20$                 no bid no bid no bid 41.40$                  
XauD#OBaEtdMEvlbUlE>BBa RBHbNDA 297.50$               no bid no bid no bid no bid
X-IgC sMIP 675.30$               no bid 675.30$                     675.30$              675.30$               
BB-" U9WEAD- no bid no bid no bid no bid 200.00$               
AIHCB U9WEAD- no bid no bid no bid no bid 1,200.00$            
BB>-GD RBHbOD>B 946.56$               no bid 946.56$                     no bid 881.56$               
cIeeD#a U9WEAD- 144.93$               no bid no bid no bid no bid
MBCHG#I RBHbOD>B 2,112.00$           no bid 2,112.00$                 no bid 1,952.00$            
MTGIRTD#DCBSeBCT"- U9WEAD- 138.13$               101.55$           103.55$                     113.48$              138.00$               
c.C-B>>Eihc U9WEAD- 1,317.50$           1,317.50$       1,317.50$                 no bid 1,317.50$            
@RHIaGI#B U9WEAD- 204.26$               167.60$           159.55$                     162.80$              173.06$               
CHGOB>EtI-a r9kl9Us 8.31.26 7.1.26 1.15.26 9.30.26
ZB-GuBH"EcTDHAB wI#B None None None None



 
 
These items are suggested for bid approval.  
   
These items are alternates and are generally not considered equal. 
 
We have used Advanced Turf Solutions, Clesen, Pendleton and Simplot in the past for the purchase of chemicals and/or fertilizers and have found 
service to be very good.  
 
 
 
 
    
  
                     
 


